
Information:
Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices
Vendor Number: 1580277
Vendor Name: Combined Roofing Services LLC,D/B/A EW Olson Roofing /
American Roofing and Repair Com

Check Details:
Check Number: E0106365
Check Amount: $ 4,827.41
Check Date: 3/18/2025

Invoice Details:
Invoice Number: 20676
Invoice Date: 3/6/2025
PO Number: B0002466
Voucher Number: V0877555

Document Type: AP Invoice

Document Below

1





Thu, Mar 6, 2025 at 08:48 PM UTC

Jeannie Hartman <jhartman@combinedroofing.com>

[External] College of DuPage - Invoice

 <jhartman@combinedroofing.com>Jeannie Hartman

CC: Bill O'Brien <bill@combinedroofing.com>

BCC:

 This email originated from outside of COD’s system. Do not click links, open attachments, or respond with sensitive CAUTION:
information unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Good Afternoon,

 

Attached is our invoice for work completed last week at College of DuPage.

 

If you need anything further please let us know.

 

 

Thanks.

 

Jeannie Hartman

Project Administrator

Combined Roofing Services, LLC

621 W. Washington Street

West Chicago, IL  60185

PH (630) 231-4422, Ext. 112

Fax (630) 231-9153



 

 

 

 

 

 

2 attachments
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250163-20676 - College of DuPage.pdf



Information:
Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices
Vendor Number: 1580277
Vendor Name: Combined Roofing Services LLC,D/B/A EW Olson Roofing /
American Roofing and Repair Com

Check Details:
Check Number: E0106365
Check Amount: $ 4,827.41
Check Date: 3/18/2025

Invoice Details:
Invoice Number: 20678
Invoice Date: 3/7/2025
PO Number: B0002466
Voucher Number: V0877570

Document Type: AP Invoice

Document Below

1





Fri, Mar 7, 2025 at 04:45 PM UTC

Jeannie Hartman <jhartman@combinedroofing.com>

RE: [External] College of DuPage - Invoice

Jeannie Hartman <jhartman@combinedroofing.com>

CC: Bill O'Brien <bill@combinedroofing.com>

BCC:

Hi Deon,

 

Here is the invoice for work completed yesterday at College of DuPage.

 

If you need anything further please let us know.

 

 

Thanks.

 

Jeannie Hartman

Project Administrator

Combined Roofing Services, LLC

621 W. Washington Street

West Chicago, IL  60185

PH (630) 231-4422, Ext. 112



Fax (630) 231-9153

 

 

 

From: King, Deon <kingd680@cod.edu> 
 Friday, March 7, 2025 5:12 AMSent:

 Jeannie Hartman <jhartman@combinedroofing.com>; Invoicing <invoicing@cod.edu>To:
 Bill O'Brien <bill@combinedroofing.com>Cc:

 RE: [External] College of DuPage - InvoiceSubject:

 

Good morning, Jeannie,

Thanks for the invoice. When you get a moment can you please send me the invoice for the work 
performed yesterday (Thursday 3/6/2025)?

I am trying to balance my books.

 

From: Jeannie Hartman < > jhartman@combinedroofing.com
 Thursday, March 6, 2025 2:49 PMSent:

 Invoicing < >; King, Deon < >To: invoicing@cod.edu kingd680@cod.edu
 Bill O'Brien < >Cc: bill@combinedroofing.com

 [External] College of DuPage - InvoiceSubject:

 



CAUTION: This email originated from outside of COD’s system. Do not click links, open attachments, or respond 
with sensitive information unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

 

Good Afternoon,

 

Attached is our invoice for work completed last week at College of DuPage.

 

If you need anything further please let us know.

 

 

Thanks.

 

Jeannie Hartman

Project Administrator

Combined Roofing Services, LLC

621 W. Washington Street

West Chicago, IL  60185

PH (630) 231-4422, Ext. 112

Fax (630) 231-9153



 

 

 

 

 

2 attachments

250216-20678 - College of DuPage.pdf
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